LEDN COUNTY SCHDOLS

BE Memorandum

RECEIVED

TO: June Kail, Director of Purchasing a&"*s
0CT 12 2012
FROM: 274 Stephen Shelton, Director of Maintenance
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
DATE: October 12, 2012 LEON COUNTY scHooLs

SUBJECT: Recommendation Letter for Bid #5134-2013 Paint and Paint Products ~ District Wide

After reviewing the documents submitted for the above mentioned bid, | am recommending that Sherwin-

Williams Pain ny be the approved primary v for this bid. The following vendor is the lowest
apparent bidder who met all specifications outlined in the bid.

Should you have any questions or concerns, please contact my office at 617-1777, ext. 1818. Thank you
for your attention to the bid information attached.

SS/edh

cC: Toni Hutto, Senior Account Clerk
Roger Kesling, Operations Manager

“Our Hands Keep Their Minds Working™
Meintenance Department - 3420 West Tharpe Street - Suite 200 - Tallahassee, Florida 32303-1138
(850) 617-1777 : Fax (850) 617-1789

www.leonki2 flus
“No person shall on the basis of gender, marital status, sexual orientation, race, religion, national ovigin, age, color or
disability be denied employment, receipt of services, access to or participation in school activities or programs if qualified to
receive such services, or otherwise be discriminated against or placed in a Rostile environment in any educational program or
activity including those receiving Federal financial assistance, except as provided by law.”



Bid No.: 5134 - 2013

Description: Paint and Paint Products District Wide
Department: Maintenance

Opening Date: September 20, 2012 @ 2:00 p.m.
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Section I: Paint Standard
1. |Waterborne Latex Gloss
1 gallon .
A |White g S 19.04 | $ 16.70 | $ 14.00
5gallon [$ 90.21 | $ 83.50 | $ 70.00
1 gallon . . .
B. |Custom Color g > 19.04 |5 16.70 | 5 2800
S5gallon |§ 90.21 | $ 83.50 | S 70.00
2. |Waterborne Latex Semi-Gloss
1 gallon .
A |White g S 1590 | $ 16.20 | $ 14.00
5gallon |§ 7451 | $ 81.00 | S 70.00
1 gallon . . .
B. |Custom Color g > 15.90 | 5 1620 | 5 2800
S5gallon |$ 7451 | $ 81.00 | $ 70.00
3. |Supplemental Items
A. |M-1 Additive / tube appr.3oz| § 8.0418$ 3.25 | S 3.20
B. |M-1 Additive / tube appr.150z( $ 2757 (S 16.25 | $ 15.20
TR R R R e R e e e
4 Latex Interior Semi-Gloss Low
" |0dor/No Odor Voc Free
1 gallon
A |Wwhite g S 13.66 | $ 17.00 | $ 16.00
5gallon |$ 63.31($ 85.00 | $ 80.00
1 gallon
B. |custom Color g S 13.66 | $ 17.00 | $ 16.00
5gallon | $ 63.31($ 85.00 | $ 80.00
Section I: Paint Standard
5. |[1-2-3 Latex Primer
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1 gallon . . .
White g S 19.63 | $ 22.00 19.95

5gallon |§ 93.13 | $ 110.00 99.75

lgallon |$ 19.63 | $ 22.00 19.95
Deep Tone

S5gallon |§ 93.13 | $ 110.00 99.75
Cover Stain Primer - Oil Ba

1 gallon . . .
White g S 1711 $ 19.75 | S 18.50

5gallon |§ 80.54 | $ 98.75 | $ 92.50

lgallon |$ 1711 | S 19.75 | $ 18.50
Custom Color

S5gallon |§ 80.54 | $ 98.75 | S 92.50
Latex Epoxy Gloss

1 gallon . . .
White g S 23.09 | $ 20.75 32.00

5gallon | NO BID $ 103.75 117.00

lgallon |$ 23.09 | $ 20.75 32.00
Custom Color

5gallon | NO BID $ 103.75 117.00
Latex Epoxy Semi-Gloss

1 gallon . . .
White g S 23.09 | $ 20.75 32.00

5gallon | NO BID $ 103.75 117.00

lgallon |$ 23.09 | $ 20.75 32.00
Custom Color

5gallon | NO BID $ 103.75 117.00
Latex Expoxy Hardner Quart (s 6.49 | $ 5.20 8.00




Section II: Paint Standard
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Section I: Paint Standard
10. |Latex Epoxy One Part (pre-cat epoxy)
1 gallon . . .
A |White g S 19.99 | $§ 2545 | S 26.00
5gallon [$ 9495 |$ 12725 S 130.00
1 gallon . . .
8. |custom Color g S 19.99 | $ 25.45 | $ 26.00
S5gallon |§ 94.95 | $ 127.25 | $ 130.00

Color Wheel

11.

Tropicoat HP Acrylic Exterior Flat

White #300

1 gallon

5 gallon

Custom Color

1 gallon

5 gallon

1 Tropicoat HP Acrylic Semi-Gloss
" |Exterior
1 gallon S [ e B
A. |White #320 8 > 12894
1 gallon R e S [ e T R e
B. |custom Color d B 1289 puwiuen b nn e
S5gallon |§ 62.45 | e e e
Color Wheel
Hi Hide Semi-Gloss Interior Latex
13.
Enamel
1 gallon g9 [Foinstotoc i e s
Sgallon S 44.95 .................................
1 gallon -7 J N, RN e
B. [Custom Color g > 20
5gallon |§ 44,95 [ s s e e
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14. (Silicone Alkyd High Gloss Exterior
1 gallon L il e e B
5 gallon S 153.44 |- oo
1 gallon 69 B R
B. [Custom Color g > SR SRR B
5gallon |§ 153.44 [ s et e
15. [Optima Endura Interior Satin Enamel
1 gallon 90 | T T T T
A. |White #820 saon 15 2290 huussunianioes
S5gallon |$§  109.49 [
1 gallon .90 o R
B. [Custom Color g > 2200 B e s
Sgallon [$  109.49 |- -i-i-i- i il
16. [Ultiza Tech
1 gallon K L e e
A |White #C145 8 > 1999 busuieiubenenanen
5gallon |§ 94.95 [ s o
1 gallon 99 [resiu s
B. |Custom Color 2 : 2922 e L
5gallon |§ 94.95 |-
Color Wheel
17. [High Solids Quick Dry Enamel
1 gallon QG [ e
A. [White #A-50 galon 15 3088 K oleaahlia
S5gallon |§ 14995 [.-.-.-.cccc
1 gallon L9 [P A
B. [Custom Color g > 30.99 Eowninion i
Sgallon |$ 149.95 |- - - o
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DEVOE
18. |Devoe Wonder Shield
1gallon [ i v o o o o e o
A, |White#tls | e e e
5gallon | s o s e e e
Tgallon [ e e e e e
B. |CustomColor = = | [ s
5 gallon ez vess soss faspn aran s s st st S s vy
19. |Devoe Wonder Shield
1 gallon
A. |White #16
5 gallon
1 gallon
B. [Custom Color
5 gallon
20. |Devoe Wonder Tone
1 gallon
A. |White #38
5 gallon
1 gallon
B. [Custom Color
5 gallon
DEVOE
21. |Devoe Mirrolac
1 gallon P R
A. |White#70 00— e e e e
S5gallon i wimin s nifion i mim i v
L gallon e v i o o o o e
B. [Custom Color

5 gallon
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Devoe Velour
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White #26

1 gallon

5 gallon

Custom Color

Glidden

1 gallon

5 gallon

Spred Ultra Exterior Flat Latex

White #6525

1 gallon

5 gallon

24,

Custom Color #6500

1 gallon

5 gallon

Spred Ultra Exterior Satin Latex

White #6725

1 gallon

5 gallon

Custom Color #6700

1 gallon

5 gallon

Glidden

25.

Ultra Hide Acrylic Latex Semi-Gloss

White #UN6300

1 gallon

5 gallon

Custom Color #UN6300

1 gallon

5 gallon




Description Quantity
26 Glid Guard Exterior Gloss Industrial
" [Enamel
) 1 gallon [BEassiiesistiss PAthRacsdh da kst |5 ) Hh s S S th e
A. |White#4550 |
Sgallon [l
1gallon Bod it i s e an s
B. |CustomColor = F———fFmrrn e
5gallon oo e s e b s s s v
27. |Ultra Hide Interior Semi-Gloss QOil
) 1 gallon [2E5Bi bl i R S S R S S
A. |White HUNS8OOO @ @ @ @ |——— e e e e e
5gallon |l e
1 gallON e s s Bt s o o
B. [Custom Color @ pFb——FTT"T""T"""""t+T"""—
5gallon [ el fo s e el
........................
Pittsburgh Paint
28. |Acrylic Exterior Paint
lgallon |.-i-i-i-i-i-0-. 5 [ m
A. |White #6-650xi BOTON Il > 19,75 Bn e
Sgallon [.c.o.nnni 1 8 78.75 |
1gallon |-=wmieme A T
B. |Custom Color 8 o 8 18IS Bl
S5gallon |- -l --i--iei- $ 78.75 Pl
29. |Acrylic Semi-Gloss House Paint
1 a”on .................................
A |White #6-901x 8 cowugy S 16801, oo
S5gallon |-.-.-.-.-.u S 8400 | . ... ...
1gallon |.:.co heJodeih ottt Dotk
B. |Custom Color BATON e 3 16.80 Lot
Sgallon [.-7.7-7-7-7-7-71 8 84.00 |- il
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30. |Hi Hide Semi-Gloss
A |White #6-500 e
Sgallon [ouisinuin u $ 83.75 |[nimite e e
lgallon |.oo-ioioieiie. 75 o m
B. [Custom Color BATON paromans > 1678 T
Sgallon |.0.0.0.0.0. 1§ 83.75 |SRiasimanidinany:
31. |Glyptex Urethane Enamel
Leallon | Yy
A |White #pP-2749 Sal0n hawamauwads 2700 Lunenenes
S5gallon |.-.-.--ooue S 135.00 |
1gallon .=t 00 B
B. [Custom Color g R 3 27.00 R e
S5gallon [.7.0.0.0n S 135.00 [.-.-.-.-c et
32. |Alkyd Satin Enamel
lgallon |.-i-i-i-ii-0. 66 [ e
A. |White #6-1110xi BN Pty > 23.66 punnuannn
5 gallon ] § 118.30 |- 0 s
1gallon |.=irooirioieie. 66 i
Sgallon |- -l--l-0-0-0- $ 11830 ...
PPG
23 Fast Dry 35 Gloss Alkyd Enamels - 95-
" 1912 Series
l1gallon |- i, .Y e
A. |White 270N Prriray > 5040 b
S5gallon [.7.0.nna 1§ 252,00 [l
1 a||0n .................................
8. |custom Color 8 i . 0t
5 gallon e I 252.00 i s




Description

Quantity

Porter
34. |Porter Acrylic Exterior Paint
_ 1 gallon B s i e s s b
A. [White#929 0z e e e e e e e
58allon £ b e e e e e e
1gallon |[omsiisn o e e
B. |Custom Color#929 @ (— 4+ 77777 "7""1T—"—"" """
5gallon s o o s
........................
35. . . .
Porter Acrylic Semi-Gloss House Paint
1 gallon [$EBi il i o R S S h i S e
A. |White#6030 % 6@ [ e
Sgallon [l
1 gallon T R e e e
B. |Custom Color #6030 I o, PR
S5gallon sl s o e
36. |Porter Hi Hide Semi-Gloss
1 gallon P e s
A. |White#105 =% @
Sgallon |l
1gallon [idsisissidiidaiddifod il
B. |Custom Color#105 = |————fFksssss oo e oo n o e an et
5gallon [owiseisimise foaa s o s
Porter
37. |Porter Glyptex Urethane Enamel
1 gallon
A. [White #4110
5 gallon
1 gallon
B. [Custom Color #4110

5 gallon
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38. [Porter Alkyd Satin Enamel
A |White #129 Lgallon Lol s
5ga||0n .................................................
B. |Custom Color #129 leallon piisenbobpus bbby,
5gallon o e s e e e e e e e e e e e e e
|
Sherwin Williams
39. |A-100 Flat Latex (Dura Craft) SW Alternate
A |White #a-6 lgallon preiovsibiinsenie] s W75l> 1235
5gallon |oivisimi i b S 73.75| $ 61.75
8. |custom Color #A-6 Lgallon Lo oulsininihnnun ] 9 1475/ M
5 gallon [SES i Rt s ! S 73.75| $ 61.75
40. |A-100 Satin Latex (Dura Craft)
A |White #A-82 1gallon klnlliipiniiiing o 15.75 I &
5 gallon [fmsssssdiiiilicn st S 78.75| $ 66.75
B. |Custom Color #A-82 Lgallon [0l 0ol il il il s 15755 1335
5gallon [ s s o s S 78.75] S 66.75
Sherwin Williams
a1 Interior Acrylic Latex Semi-Gloss (200
" {s/G)
A White #750 1ga||0n S 16.00 s 13.50
Sgallon [.0.0.n.n.n.n ]ttt $ 80.00( $ 67.50
1 e e e T e e e ] 16.00 13.
B. |Custom Color #PB7505152 gallon s sampiasinneny > > 3-50
S5gallon | v foramimi e ] S 80.00( $ 67.50
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42. |Industrial Enamel
1 gallon ;
A. |White #B54 g ]2 16.75
5 gallon S 83.75
1 gallon
B. [Custom Color #B54 g > 16.75
5 gallon S 83.75
43, [Classic 99 (200 S/G)
1 gallon | o e e
A. |white #B34 & e 5 16.75
Sgallon ............................... S 83.75
1gallon |2ttt
B. [Custom Color #B34 L S > 16.75
Sgallon |- lele il ol 83.75
a4 High Gloss Metal Finishing Enamel -
" [cc-B32
1 gallon
A. |White g 25.00
5 gallon s s funiu v 125.00
1 a”on ...............................
B |Custom Color d Aiddded dddodd 0
S5gallon |- S 125.00
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Opened By:

June Kail

Date:

9/20/2012

Recorded By:

Willie Curtis

Date:

9/20/2012
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